

BID TALLY SHEET

Lake County Forest Preserves

www.LCFPD.org



PROJECT: Small Invasive Tree & Shrub Control 2018/2019

BID #: 19002

BID OPENING DATE: August 21, 2018 @ 10:00 a.m. Local Time

REF. NO.	VENDOR	BID BOND Y/N	ACK ADD Y/N	Multiple Forest Preserves	Lyons Woods Forest Preserve	Chiwaukee Prairie	Illinois Beach State Park	Alternate BA 1.	Alternate BA 2.
1	NATIVE RESTORATION SVCS	Y	Y	NO BID	40,000.00	147,000.00	NO BID	8,000.00	20,000.00
2	APPLIED ECOLOGICAL SVCS	Y	Y	NO BID	NO BID	102,655.00	149,583.00	64,000.00	16,000.00
3	LIBERTY PRAIRIE RESTORATION	Y	Y	NO BID	29,350.00	NO BID	NO BID	5,870.00	14,675.00
4	RED BURNED NURSERY	Y	Y	NO BID	39,450.00	NO BID	NO BID	8,500.00	21,250.00
5	EVCAP, INC.	Y	Y	404,875.00	38,750.00	170,625.00	248,625.00	8,000.00	20,000.00
6	INTEGRATED LAKES MGMT	Y	Y	483,000.00	46,000.00	161,000.00	234,600.00	92,000.00	23,000.00

PURCHASING REPRESENTATIVE

DATE

[Signature]

8/21/18

DATE

8/21/18

WITNESS

BID TALLY SHEET

Lake County Forest Preserves

www.LCFPD.org



PROJECT: Small Invasive Tree & Shrub Control 2018/2019

BID #: 19002

BID OPENING DATE: August 21, 2018 @ 10:00 a.m. Local Time

REF. NO.	VENDOR	BID BOND Y/N	ACK ADD Y/N	Multiple Forest Preserves	Lyons Woods Forest Preserve	Chiwaukee Prairie	Illinois Beach State Park	Alternate BA 1.	Alternate BA 2.
7	TALGROSS RESTAURANT	Y	Y		71,000.00	248,500.00	362,000.00	14,200.00	35,500.00 35,500
8	P1220 & H550C	Y	Y	NO BID	29,300.00	NO BID	149,430.00	5,860.00	14,650.00
9									
10									
11									
12									

PURCHASING REPRESENTATIVE

DATE

WITNESS

DATE

[Signature]

8/21/18

[Signature]

8/21/18